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KERALA UNIVERSITY OF HEALTH SCIENCES

 
 

ABSTRACT
 
KUHS-  Academic–  Decision  of  Faculty  of  Nursing–  Implementation  of  Credit  System  and
Semester system / Competency Based Curriculum for BSc Nursing Programme as per Indian
Nursing Council (Indian Nursing Council Revised Regulations and Curriculum for BSc Nursing
programme, Regulations, 2020) Gazette notification dated 5/7/2021 - Implemented subject to
ratification by Academic Council and Governing Council - Orders issued. 

 
ACADEMIC SECTION

 
 

 

Read :- 1.Minutes of Board of Studies UG Nursing held on 14.09.2021
             2.Minutes of Faculty of Nursing held on 12.10.2021
     

 
ORDER

 
      As per the paper read (1) above, the meeting of Board of Studies of UG Nursing dated 
14.09.2021  reviewed and modified the MSR, Course, syllabus, regulations, scheme of 
examination, to prepare an addendum to the revised regulations and curriculum for BSc 
Nursing programme by INC.
     The above minutes of Board of Studies of UG Nursing was placed before the Faculty of 
Nursing dated 12.10.2021.
     Vide paper read (2) above, the Faculty of Nursing has recommended to implement the 
revised curriculum in totality for the BSc Nursing programme from the academic year 2021-22 
in a phased manner, as the process of affiliation of BSc Nursing programme are getting over 
or in progress based on the existing MSR and the applications are already invited from 
candidates for admission to the BSC (N) programme for the academic year 2021-22. Hence the
revision of MSR and criteria for selection of candidates to BSC (N) programme based on 
Entrance examination conducted either by the University or by the State Govt. was decided to 
implement in a phased manner from next academic year (2022-2023) onwards. A Faculty 
orientation regarding the implementation of revision through online platform was also 
suggested.
     It was suggested to add a comprehensive set of Model Question papers, References and 
Transcripts in the revised syllabus and to prepare model Mark lists for all semesters. Meeting 
decided to ensure 100% attendance in practical subjects before issue of Provisional Degree 
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Certificates once the revised scheme is implemented.
     In the circumstances, sanction is hereby accorded  to implement the above decisions of 
Faculty of Nursing, considering the fact that cut off date of admission for 2021-22 is 31.12.2021 
and classes is slated to commence on 01.01.2022, subject to ratification by Academic Council 
and Governing Council.
 

(By order of Vice Chancellor)
   

 
 

Deputy Registrar
To
          1.Examination Nursing Section
          2.IT Section   
 
Copy To,
          PA to VC/PA to PVC/ PA to Registrar/CE/SF/OC

Forwarded/By Order

  
Section Officer

 


